## Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

### 8708 Jefferson Highway Suite A Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

Fax:(225) 766-7800

May 1, 2013

	astle Avenue, Building 2			May 1, 2013
	N G 1 D1 1		File #:	1107-0004
Attention:	Ms. Sandy Edmonds		Inv #:	8027
RE: Ro	obert Burns, et al v LALB			
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Apr-02-13	Review of pleading	0.50	75.00	LSB
Apr-03-13	Review of petition;	0.40	60.00	LSB
Apr-04-13	Review of Petition.	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Review of Law concerning Petition.	0.20	25.00	THL
Apr-05-13	Legal research regarding	0.60	75.00	JHL
	Began preparing exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Discussed legal issues with	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Legal research regarding	0.20	25.00	JHL
Apr-08-13	Review of research by associate; assign task to associate	0.40	60.00	LSB
	Review revised exception and motion	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Legal research regarding form	1.50	187.50	JHL

	Preparation of Exception of Non-Conformity, Motion to Strike, Order, and Memorandum in Support.	2.10	262.50	JHL
Apr-09-13	Email to all regarding lawsuit and proposed pleading.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Revised Exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-10-13	Receipt and review of email from on hearing notice	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Correspondence with regarding pleadings.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Correspondence with egarding Exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Review of minutes from	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Revised Exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-12-13	Revised Exception and Motion to Strike.	0.30	37.50	JHL
Apr-15-13	Receipt and review of email; assign task to associate	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Legal research regarding	0.60	75.00	JHL
	Letter to the Court regarding Exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Apr-17-13	Phone call from egarding service.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email to regarding service on board members.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Apr-30-13	Receipt and review of notice of continuation of hearing	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Totals	9.90	\$1,297.50	

### DISBURSEMENTS

Invoice #:	8027	Page 3		May 1, 2013
Apr-16-13	Postage - to COC filing (plus return envelope)	Dilatory Exception	3.38	
Apr-30-13	Photocopies - 48 BW @	\$0.10 each	4.80	
	Totals		 \$8.18	
	Total Fee & Disbursen	ients	W.	\$1,305.68
	Balance Now Due			\$1,305.68

TAX ID Number 20-

20-5978929

Ph:(225) 766-3800

11736 Newcast Suite C Baton Rouge, I	ioneers Licensing Board le Avenue, Building 2 A			June 3, 2013
70816			File #:	1107-0004
Attention: N	As. Sandy Edmonds		Inv #:	8152
RE: Robe	ert Burns, et al v LALB			
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
May-20-13	Phone call from Judge's office regarding Exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL
May-21-13	Receipt and review of email from Robert Burns; forward	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Discussed legal issues with LSB.	0.20	25.00	JHL
May-28-13	Receipt and review of summary of 10.1 conference hearing	0.20	30.00	LSB
May-29-13	Receipt and review of email; assign task to	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Totals	0.70	\$97.50	
DISBURSEME	ENTS			
May-30-13	Photocopies - 48 BW @ \$0.10 each		4.80	
	Totals		\$4.80	
	Total Fee & Disbursements	•		\$102.30
	Previous Balance			1,305.68
	Previous Payments			1,305.68

Invoice #:	8152	Page 2	June 3, 2013
	Balance Now Due		\$102.30
TAX ID Num	ber 20-5978929		
PAYMENT I	DETAILS		_
May-09-13	For Services Rendered	1	1,305.68
	Total Payments		\$1,305.68

Ph:(225) 766-3800

11736 Newcastl Suite C Baton Rouge, L	oneers Licensing Board le Avenue, Building 2 A			July 2, 2013
70816			File#:	1107-0004
Attention: M	s. Sandy Edmonds		Inv #:	8246
RE: Rober	rt Burns, et al v LALB			
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jun-10-13	Calendar hearing date	0.10	15.00	LSB
Jun-11-13	Receipt and review of signed letter from the court regarding exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	0.20	\$27.50	
	Total Fee & Disbursements		**	\$27.50
	Previous Balance			102.30
	Previous Payments			102.30
	Balance Now Due		-	\$27.50
TAX ID Numbe	т 20-5978929			
PAYMENT DE	TAILS			
Jun-06-13	For Services Rendered			102.30
	Total Payments		-	\$102.30

## Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. 8708 Jefferson Highway

8708 Jefferson Highway Suite A. Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board 11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2 Suite C Baton Rouge, LA			A	ugust 6, 2013	
70816				File#:	1107-0004
Attention: M	fs. Sandy Edmonds			Inv #:	8377
RE: Robe	ert Burns, et al v LALB				
DATE	DESCRIPTION		HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jun-10-13	Calendar hearing date		0.10	15.00	LSB
Jun-11-13	Receipt and review of signed letter from the court regarding exception.	<b>;</b>	0.10	12.50	JHL
Jul-15-13	Receipt and review of memorandum in opposition to dilatory exception		0.50	75.00	LSB
	Review of Burns' Memorandum in Opposition to Dilatory Exception and all attachements.	on	0.30	37.50	JHL
Jul-18-13	Prepartion for hearing on exception.		0.50	62.50	JHL
Jul-19-13	Review of pleadings and law in preparation hearing on exceptions.	for	1.20	150.00	JHL
Jul-22-13	Attend hearing		0.50	75.00	LSB
	Hearing on Exception at the 19th JDC.		1.10	0.00	JHL
	Prepartion for hearing on Exception.		0.20	25.00	JHL
Jul-23-13	Email from		0.10	15.00	LSB
	Totals		4.60	\$467.50	

DISBURSEME	NTS			
Jul-31-13	Photocopies - 54 BW at \$0.10 each		5.40	
	Totals	***************************************	\$5.40	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			\$472.90
·	Retainers Applied			27.50
	Previous Balance			102.30
	Previous Payments		•	102.30
	Balance Now Due	•	_	\$445.40
TAX ID Number	20-5978929			
PAYMENT DE	TAILS			
Jun-06-13	For Services Rendered			102.30

Page 2

August 6, 2013

27.50

\$129.80

Invoice #:

Aug-06-13

For Services Rendered

**Total Payments** 

8377

Ph:(225) 766-3800

	oneers Licensing Board e Avenue, Building 2		September 4, 2013	
70816			File#:	1107-0004
Attention: M	s. Sandy Edmonds		Inv #:	8464
RE: Robe	rt Burns, et al v LALB			
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Aug-14-13	Review of	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Totals	0.25	\$37.50	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			\$37.50
•	Previous Balance			445.40
	Previous Payments			445.40
	Balance Now Due		· ·	\$37.50
TAX ID Numbe	er 20-5978929			
PAYMENT DE	ETAILS			
Aug-12-13	For Services Rendered			445.40
	Total Payments		-	\$445.40

## Bankston & Associates, L.L.C. 8708 Jefferson Highway

8708 Jefferson Highway Suite A Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Louisiana Aucti 11736 Newcast Suite C Baton Rouge, L	Oc	tober 2, 2013		
70816			File#;	1107-0004
Attention: M	Is. Sandy Edmonds		Inv #:	8625
RE: Robert Burns, et al v LALB				
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Sep-04-13	Review of	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Returned phone call.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Sep-05-13	Review of Ruling.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Prepared Judgment.	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Email to Judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Sep-09-13	Receipt and review of	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Review of	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Revised Judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email to regarding revised Judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Correspondence from objection to proposed judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Sep-10-13	Revised proposed judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL

Invoice #:	8625 Page 2		Oc	tober 2, 2013
	Email to regarding proposed judgment.	0.10	12.50	THI
Sep-11-13	Correspondence from egarding proposed judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Sep-16-13	Review of email from	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Correspondence from Burns regarding lett Judge Hernandez concerning proposed judgment and time for amending petition.	er to 0.30	37.50	IHL
Sep-17-13	Letter to the court regarding judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	2.20	\$287.50	
DISBURSEMENTS				
Sep-18-13	Postage - to COC filing judgment plus retrenvelope	urn .	1.52	
Sep-30-13	Photocopies - 3 BW @ \$ 0.10 each		0.30	
	Totals	_	\$1.82	
	Total Fee & Disbursements		•	\$289.32
•	Previous Balance			37.50
	Previous Payments			37.50
	Balance Now Due		•	\$289.32
TAX ID Num	ber 20-5978929			
PAYMENT 1	DETAILS			
Sep-13-13	For Services Rendered			37.50
	Total Payments			\$37.50

# Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway Suite A Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

11736 Newcast Suite C Baton Rouge, L	ioneers Licensing Board le Avenue, Building 2		Nove	mber 5, 2013	
70816			File#:	1107-0004	
Attention: M	Is. Sandy Edmonds		Inv #:	8804	
RE: Robert Burns, et al v LALB					
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER	
Oct-07-13	Receipt and review of executed judgment	0.10	15.00	LSB	
Oct-28-13	Receipt and review of amended petition;	0.25	37.50	LSB	
Oct-29-13	Review of Burns' Amendment to Pleadings.	0.20	25.00	JHL	
	Email to Sandy and Tessa regarding Amendment to Pleadings.	0.10	12.50	JHL	
Oct-31-13	Discussed	0.10	12.50	JHL	
	Totals	0.75	\$102.50		
	Total Fee & Disbursements	•	-	\$102.50	
	Previous Balance			289.32	
	Previous Payments			289.32	
	Balance Now Due		-	\$102.50	

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

**PAYMENT DETAILS** 

Invoice #: 8804 Page 2 November 5, 2013
Oct-09-13 For Services Rendered 289.32

Total Payments \$289.32

# Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway Suite A Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

Fax:(225) 766-7800

December 4, 2013

	table Avenue, Building 2		Dece	MIDEL 4, 2013
70010			File #:	1107-0004
Attention:	Ms. Sandy Edmonds		Inv #:	8893
RE: Rob	pert Burns, et al v LALB			
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Nov-05-13	Receipt and review of exception;	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Legal research regarding	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Prepared Second Exception of Noncompliance and Motion to Strike.	0.80	100.00	JHL
Nov-06-13	Review of draft of further exceptions	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Legal research regarding	0.50	62.50	JHL
	Revised Dilatory Exception and Memorandum in Support.	0.50	62.50	JHL
Nov-07-13	Final revisions to Exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL
,	Totals	2.55	\$330.00	
DISBURSEM	ENTS			
Nov-08-13	Postage - to COC filing Dilatory Exception of Non-Conformity (plus return envelope)		3.44	
D 00 10	Postage - Copy to Judge Hernandez	,	0.86 4.40	
Dec-02-13	Photocopies - 44 BW @ \$0.10 each		4.40	

Invoice #:	8893	Page	2	December 4, 2013	
	Totals	•		\$8.70	
	Total Fee & D	ichurcamante		-	\$338.70
	Previous Balar				102.50
	Previous Paym	ents		***	102.50
	Balance Now	Due		_	\$338.70
TAX ID Nur	nber 20-597892	9			
PAYMENT	DETAILS				

102.50

\$102.50

Nov-07-13

For Services Rendered

**Total Payments** 

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Louisiana Aucti 11736 Newcastl Suite C Baton Rouge, L		January 6, 2014				
70816			File #:	1107-0004		
Attention: M	s. Sandy Edmonds		Inv #:	8978		
RE: Rober	rt Burns, et al v LALB					
DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER		
Dec-05-13	Receipt and review of notice from the court regarding exception hearing.	0.10	12.50	JHL		
Dec-09-13	Receipt and review of Notice from the court regarding dilatory exception of non-conformity.	0.10	12.50	JHL		
Dec-16-13	Receipt and review of signed order from the court regarding exception.	0.10	12.50	JHL		
Jan-03-14	Correspondence from Burns regarding docker changes.	0.10	12.50	JHL		
	Totals	0.40	\$50.00			
	Total Fee & Disbursements		-	\$50.00		
	Previous Balance			338.70		
	Previous Payments			338.70		
	Balance Now Due		•	\$50.00		
TAX ID Numbe	er 20-5978929					
PAYMENT DETAILS .						
Jan-02-14	For Services Rendered			338.70		

Invoice #: 8978 Page 2 January 6, 2014

Total Payments \$338.70