

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

February 1, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 7745

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jan-01-13	Receipt and review of notice from court regarding hearing.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Jan-03-13	Prepared letter to Burns regarding the re-opening of his administrative hearing.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Jan-08-13	Prepared Joint Motion and Order for Extension of Time to Respond.	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Prepared letter to Burns regarding Joint Motion for Extension of Time to Respond.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Revised Joint Motion for Extension of Time to Respond.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Jan-14-13	Phone call from Sandy regarding Mayeaux.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Jan-17-13	Research Louisiana case law on whether 	2.00	120.00	PL2
	Draft answer to plaintiff's original and amended petition,	1.00	60.00	PL2
	Draft motion for summary judgement with supporting memorandum in response to plaintiffs suit for damages in action alleging violations of Open Meetings Law.	3.50	210.00	PL2

Jan-18-13	Review of Plaintiff's Amendment to Pleading.	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Revised Answer to Original Petition and Amendment to Pleading.	1.20	150.00	JHL
	Revised Motion for Summary Judgment, Order, and Memorandum in Support.	1.70	212.50	JHL
	Draft motion for summary judgement with supporting memorandum in response to plaintiffs suit for damages in action alleging violations of Open Meetings Law.	1.50	90.00	PL2
Jan-19-13	Revise petition; review motion for summary judgment and memorandum	1.00	150.00	LSB
Jan-21-13	Final revisions to Answer.	0.80	100.00	JHL
	Legal research regarding Open Meetings Law, Administrative Procedures Act, case law.	0.50	62.50	JHL
	Revised Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.90	112.50	JHL
Jan-22-13	Final revisions to Motion for Summary Judgment - filing today.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Letter to Court regarding Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Correspondence with Burns regarding cancellation of Febraury hearing for extension of time.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Review of Order on Court Connect.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Prepared letter to Judge Fields regarding cancellation of hearing on Motion for Extension.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Jan-23-13	Review of letter to clerk of court	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Totals	16.20	\$1,532.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

Nov-29-12	Postage - Letter to Robert Burns - Certified Mail, Return Receipt Requested		5.55	
-----------	---	--	------	--

Jan-09-13	Postage - letter to R. Burns enclosing joint motion for extension	0.00
Jan-22-13	Postage - Letter to Judge Fields	0.45
Jan-31-13	Photocopies - 63 BW @ \$0.10 each	6.30
	Totals	<u>\$12.95</u>

	Total Fee & Disbursements	<u>\$1,545.45</u>
	Previous Balance	1,158.45
	Previous Payments	1,158.45
	Balance Now Due	<u>\$1,545.45</u>

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Jan-08-13	For Services Rendered	1,158.45
	Total Payments	<u>\$1,158.45</u>

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

March 4, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 7838

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Feb-01-13	Correspondence with Sandy regarding transcription of hearing.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Feb-04-13	Email to Loretta Davis regarding transcript.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Feb-06-13	Review of findings of fact.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Prepared Motion to Supplement Summary Judgment Exhibits and Memorandum in Support.	0.50	62.50	JHL
Feb-07-13	Email to Burns regarding findings of fact.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Feb-14-13	calendar date for hearing on Motion for Summary Judgment filed by Plaintiff and Defendant and date oppositions due	0.10	6.50	PL1
Feb-18-13	Draft memorandum in opposition to plaintiff's motion for summary judgment.	3.75	225.00	PL2
Feb-20-13	Review of draft memo in opposition	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Reviewed and revised Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.60	75.00	JHL
	Final edits and revisions to Memorandum in Support of Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.20	25.00	JHL

Invoice #: 7838

Page 2

March 4, 2013

Feb-21-13	Letter to Court regarding Opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Feb-26-13	Email to Loretta Davis regarding transcript request.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Mar-01-13	Email to Sandy regarding minutes and transcript.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Phone call to Lori Cobb Reporting regarding transcript.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	6.45	\$569.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

Feb-21-13	Postage to COC filing D's Opposition to P's motion for summary judgment (plus return envelope)	2.32
Feb-28-13	Photocopies - 21 BW @ \$0.10 each	2.10
	Totals	\$4.42

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$573.42
Previous Balance	1,545.45
Previous Payments	1,545.45
Balance Now Due	\$573.42

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Feb-08-13	For Services Rendered	1,545.45
	Total Payments	\$1,545.45

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

April 2, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 7919

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Mar-01-13	Review of case law on issue of revenue production	0.50	75.00	LSB
Mar-05-13	Report to board on litigation	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Receipt and review of transcript of the January 8, 2013 hearing.	0.40	50.00	JHL
Mar-07-13	Discussed legal issues with LSB.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Mar-11-13	Email to Sandy regarding board minutes.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Mar-12-13	Correspondence with Sandy regarding board minutes.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Mar-22-13	Review of supplement to court on motion for summary judgment	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Phone call to Sandy regarding board minutes.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email to Sandy regarding board minutes.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Revised Motion and Memorandum to Supplement Summary Judgment Exhibits.	0.40	50.00	JHL
Mar-23-13	Preparation for hearing on Motion for Summary Judgment	0.75	112.50	LSB

Invoice #: 7919

Page 2

April 2, 2013

Mar-25-13	Attend motion day in Judge Fields' court; report to client	1.75	262.50	LSB
Apr-01-13	Prepared Order regarding Motion to Supplement Exhibits.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Prepared letter to the court regarding Order.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	5.20	\$737.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

Apr-01-13	Filing Fee		5.00	
	Photocopies - 23 BW @ \$0.10 each		2.30	
	Parking		4.00	
	Totals		\$11.30	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			\$748.80
	Previous Balance			573.42
	Previous Payments			573.42
	Balance Now Due			\$748.80

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Mar-08-13	For Services Rendered			573.42
	Total Payments			\$573.42

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

May 1, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 8024

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Apr-04-13	Prepared letter to Burns regarding deposition.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Apr-11-13	Receipt and review of email and select deposition date	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Email from Burns regarding deposition.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	prepare Notice of Deposition of Burns	0.30	19.50	PL1
	letter to Burns with notice of deposition	0.20	13.00	PL1
Apr-15-13	Review of discovery to Burns; [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Prepared requests for admissions, interrogatories, and requests for production to be answered by Burns.	1.20	150.00	JHL
Apr-30-13	Receipt and review of discovery responses from Burns; assign task to associate; copy to Board members	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Totals	2.95	\$362.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

Invoice #: 8024

Page 2

May 1, 2013

Apr-02-13	Postage - to COC filing Defendant's Order (plus return envelope)	1.92
Apr-05-13	Postage - Copy to Judge Fields	0.86
Apr-15-13	Postage - Letter to Robert Burns regarding deposition dates	0.46
Apr-15-13	Postage - Notice of Deposition to Robert Burns (CM/RRR)	6.11
Apr-30-13	Photocopies - 58 BW @ \$0.10 each	5.80
	Totals	<hr/> \$15.15
	Total Fee & Disbursements	<hr/> \$377.65
	Previous Balance	748.80
	Previous Payments	748.80
	Balance Now Due	<hr/> \$377.65

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Apr-15-13	For Services Rendered	748.80
	Total Payments	<hr/> \$748.80

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

June 3, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 8150

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
May-02-13	Review of Burns' discovery responses.	0.50	62.50	JHL
May-07-13	Revised public records request.	0.10	12.50	JHL
May-09-13	Email from [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
May-16-13	Review of draft letter to Burns	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Discussed legal issues with LSB regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Revised letter to Burns regarding discovery.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Preparation for the deposition of [REDACTED] reviewed pleadings and discovery; prepared [REDACTED]	1.50	187.50	JHL
May-21-13	Email to Burns regarding discovery conference.	0.20	25.00	JHL
May-22-13	Receipt and review of records in response to public records request.	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Correspondence with Burns regarding discovery conference.	0.10	12.50	JHL
May-23-13	Email from Burns regarding discovery conference.	0.10	12.50	JHL

May-28-13	Receipt and review of notice of calendaring of hearing	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Review of Plaintiff's discovery responses in preparation for discovery conference.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Participated in a Rule 10.1 conference with Robert Burns.	0.50	62.50	JHL
	E-mail to Robert Burns summarizing the discovery conference.	0.30	37.50	JHL
May-29-13	Email from Burns regarding discovery conference and supplemental responses.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email to [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Totals	4.80	\$607.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

	Photocopies	7.50
May-07-13	Postage - to State Board regarding records	0.46
May-13-13	Postage - check to State Board of CPAs for copies	0.46
May-16-13	Postage - Letter to Robert Burns (CM/RRR)	6.11
May-30-13	Photocopies - 58 BW @ \$0.10 each	5.80
	Totals	\$20.33

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$627.83
Previous Balance	377.65
Previous Payments	377.65
Balance Now Due	\$627.83

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

May-09-13	For Services Rendered	377.65
	Total Payments	\$377.65

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

July 2, 2013

11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2

Suite C

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

File #: 1107-0002

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

Inv #: 8244

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jun-25-13	Receipt and review of plaintiff's supplemental responses to discovery; assign task to associate	0.40	60.00	LSB
Jun-28-13	Review of Burns' supplemental discovery responses.	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Email to [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	0.90	\$122.50	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			\$122.50
	Previous Balance			627.83
	Previous Payments			627.83
	Balance Now Due			\$122.50

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Jun-06-13	For Services Rendered			627.83
	Total Payments			\$627.83

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

August 6, 2013

11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2

Suite C

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

File #: 1107-0002

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

Inv #: 8376

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jun-25-13	Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00	LSB
Jun-28-13	Review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Email to [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
Jul-22-13	Email to [REDACTED] regarding deposition of [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	letter to [REDACTED] for deposition dates	0.20	13.00	PL1
Jul-25-13	Review of notice of deposition and letter to [REDACTED] review of case law	0.20	30.00	LSB
	draft Notice of Deposition for [REDACTED]	0.30	19.50	PL1
	letter to [REDACTED] enclosing Notice of Deposition	0.20	13.00	PL1
Jul-29-13	Review of file; request information from [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00	LSB
	Receipt and review of judgment proposed by [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Review of deposition notice.	0.10	12.50	JHL

Totals	2.60	\$313.00
--------	------	----------

DISBURSEMENTS

Jul-23-13	Postage - Letter to Robert Burns	0.46
Jul-25-13	Postage - Notice of deposition to Robert Burns	0.46

Totals		\$0.92
--------	--	--------

Total Fee & Disbursements		\$313.92
Retainers Applied		122.50
Previous Balance		627.83
Previous Payments		627.83
Balance Now Due		\$191.42

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Jun-06-13	For Services Rendered	627.83
Aug-06-13	For Services Rendered	122.50
Total Payments		\$750.33

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

September 4, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002
Inv #: 8462

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Aug-07-13	Receipt and review of letter from [REDACTED]	0.10	15.00	LSB
Aug-14-13	Review of file and prepare [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
Aug-23-13	Receipt and review of email and [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Legal research regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.70	87.50	JHL
	Prepared letter to Burns regarding videotaping deposition.	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Discussed preparation for [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
Aug-26-13	Email from Burns; email and letter to Burns; respond to email from Burns	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Correspondence from Burns regarding deposition.	0.30	37.50	JHL
Aug-28-13	Preparation of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	125.00	JHL
Sep-03-13	Email from Burns regarding videotaping the deposition.	0.10	12.50	JHL

Totals	3.85	<u>\$515.00</u>
--------	------	-----------------

DISBURSEMENTS

Aug-26-13	Postage - Letter to Robert Burns regarding deposition	0.46
-----------	---	------

Totals		<u>\$0.46</u>
--------	--	---------------

Total Fee & Disbursements		<u>\$515.46</u>
--------------------------------------	--	------------------------

Previous Balance		191.42
------------------	--	--------

Previous Payments		191.42
-------------------	--	--------

Balance Now Due		<u>\$515.46</u>
------------------------	--	------------------------

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Aug-12-13	For Services Rendered	191.42
-----------	-----------------------	--------

Total Payments		<u>\$191.42</u>
-----------------------	--	------------------------

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

October 2, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0005

Inv #: 8626

RE: Robert Burns vs. LA Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Sep-19-13	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00	LSB
Sep-25-13	Revised Motion for Extension.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	draft [REDACTED]	0.40	26.00	PL1
Sep-30-13	Review of [REDACTED]	0.90	112.50	JHL
	Totals	2.40	\$301.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

Sep-30-13	Photocopies - 6 BW @ \$ 0.10 each	0.60
	Totals	\$0.60

Total Fee & Disbursements \$301.60

Balance Now Due \$301.60

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

October 2, 2013

11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2

Suite C

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 8623

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Aug-19-13	Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00	LSB
Sep-03-13	Email [REDACTED] respond by email; email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.35	52.50	LSB
Sep-04-13	Correspondence from Burns regarding deposition and videotaping.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Sep-19-13	Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Review email and respond	0.25	37.50	LSB
Sep-23-13	Email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	1.80	\$265.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

Sep-30-13	Photocopies - 2 BW @ \$ 0.10 each	0.20
	Totals	\$0.20

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$265.20

Invoice #: 8623

Page 2

October 2, 2013

Previous Balance

515.46

Previous Payments

515.46

Balance Now Due

\$265.20

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Sep-13-13 For Services Rendered

515.46

Total Payments

\$515.46

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

November 5, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 8802

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Oct-09-13	Receipt and review of Plaintiff's motion for sanctions and signed order setting hearing.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Email to Burns regarding request to reschedule hearing.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email from Burns regarding Order.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Review of [REDACTED] regarding hearing.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Phone call to Judge's office regarding signed order.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Correspondence with Burns regarding hearings.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Oct-10-13	Correspondence with Burns regarding status conference.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Oct-14-13	Prepared Motion and Order to Reset Hearing Date.	0.40	50.00	JHL
Oct-15-13	Letter to the court regarding continuance.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Phone call from Burns regarding motion.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Oct-16-13	Review of [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL

	Legal research regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Preparation of Opposition to Motion for Sanctions.	0.70	87.50	JHL
Oct-17-13	Review of [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Review of correspondence with Burns regarding discovery matters.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Preparation of Opposition to Motion for Sanctions.	2.20	275.00	JHL
	Preparation of Motion to Compel plaintiff's deposition.	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Prepared Rule to Show Cause for Motion to Compel Deposition.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Revised Motion to Compel Deposition.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Prepared documents to be attached as evidence to Motion to Compel and Opposition to Sanctions.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Oct-21-13	Prepared exhibits to be attached as evidence to Motion to Compel Deposition and Opposition to Motion for Sanctions.	0.60	75.00	JHL
Oct-22-13	Letter to the court regarding opposition to motion for sanctions.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Phone call from Burns regarding filings.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Oct-28-13	Receipt and review of notice of hearing	0.10	15.00	LSB
Nov-01-13	Receipt and review of filed memo in opposition	0.10	15.00	LSB
Nov-04-13	Notice from the Court regarding status conference.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Totals	7.70	<u>967.50</u>	

DISBURSEMENTS

Oct-15-13	postage- to COC filing unopposed motion to reset hearing date (plus return envelope)	1.32
Nov-01-13	Photocopies - 131 BW @ \$0.10 each	13.10
	Totals	<hr/> \$14.42
	Total Fee & Disbursements	<hr/> \$981.92
	Previous Balance	265.20
	Previous Payments	265.20
	Balance Now Due	<hr/> \$981.92

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Oct-09-13	For Services Rendered	265.20
	Total Payments	<hr/> \$265.20

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

December 4, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 8891

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Nov-08-13	Receipt and review of notice of hearing and calendar	0.10	15.00	LSB
Nov-21-13	Review of memo and pleadings file; letter on [REDACTED] issue	0.50	75.00	LSB
Nov-22-13	Review and calendar motion to compel deposition and sanctions	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Receipt and review of Burns' Memorandum Reiterating Petitioner's Lack of Objections to Providing Deposition and all exhibits.	0.50	62.50	JHL
Nov-27-13	Preparation for hearing on December 2, 2013.	0.40	50.00	JHL
Dec-02-13	Hearing on Plaintiff's Motion for Sanctions and on LALB's Motion to Compel Deposition.	1.50	187.50	JHL
	Prepared Judgment.	0.40	50.00	JHL
	Email to Burns regarding proposed Judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email from Burns regarding draft judgment.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email to Sandy regarding hearings today.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Totals	3.90	\$505.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

Dec-02-13	Photocopies - 8 BW @ \$0.10 each	0.80
	Totals	<u>\$0.80</u>
	Total Fee & Disbursements	<u>\$505.80</u>
	Previous Balance	981.92
	Previous Payments	981.92
	Balance Now Due	<u>\$505.80</u>

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Nov-07-13	For Services Rendered	981.92
	Total Payments	<u>\$981.92</u>

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

January 6, 2014

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 8976

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Dec-02-13	Review of draft order	0.40	60.00	LSB
Dec-10-13	Review of pleadings in preparation for status conference.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Dec-11-13	Status Conference.	1.70	212.50	JHL
Dec-12-13	Email to Sandy regarding trial date.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Dec-13-13	Receipt and review of notice from the Court.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Dec-20-13	Discussed status conference with LSB.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Dec-23-13	Correspondence from Burns regarding deposition.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Dec-26-13	Receipt and review of email; fix deposition date	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Correspondence from Burns regarding witnesses.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Correspondence from [REDACTED] regarding deposition.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Review of Notice of Deposition.	0.10	12.50	JHL

Totals	3.40	\$440.00
--------	------	----------

DISBURSEMENTS

Dec-04-13	Postage - to COC filing judgment plus return envelope	1.32
	Postage - copy of judgment to Judge Fields	0.46
Jan-02-14	Photocopies - 2 BW @ \$0.10 each	0.20
Totals		\$1.98

Total Fee & Disbursements		\$441.98
Previous Balance		505.80
Previous Payments		505.80
Balance Now Due		\$441.98

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Jan-02-14	For Services Rendered	505.80
Total Payments		\$505.80