

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

April 2, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0003

Inv #: 7920

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-----------|---|-------|--------|--------|
| Mar-04-13 | Review of documents from Anna Dow; telephone call to Anna; open new file | 1.00 | 150.00 | LSB |
| Mar-05-13 | Email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 0.25 | 37.50 | LSB |
| Mar-06-13 | Receipt and review of duties of Ken Buhler | 0.40 | 60.00 | LSB |
| Mar-08-13 | Telephone call regarding hearing date; email to confirm date | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |
| | Revise affidavit; email to [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 30.00 | LSB |
| Mar-11-13 | Receipt and review of reinstated bond | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |
| | Telephone call from Anna Dow regarding hearing | 0.25 | 37.50 | LSB |
| Mar-18-13 | Telephone call to Fasola; Jim Steele; email to Sandy Edmonds | 0.50 | 75.00 | LSB |
| Mar-19-13 | Review of file; meeting with Jim Steele | 0.75 | 112.50 | LSB |
| Mar-25-13 | Preparation for hearing; email to Anna Dow requesting better copies | 1.00 | 150.00 | LSB |
| Mar-26-13 | Proceed with hearing on Ken and Mac Buhler | 4.00 | 600.00 | LSB |

| | | | | |
|-----------|--|------|-------------------|-----|
| | Discussed legal issues with LSB. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Mar-27-13 | Receipt and review of email from Edmonds; email to [REDACTED] | 0.25 | 37.50 | LSB |
| | Telephone call to Anna Dow on Buhler | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |
| Mar-29-13 | Receipt and review of email; review of findings of fact; respond to email | 0.35 | 52.50 | LSB |
| | Totals | 9.35 | <u>\$1,400.00</u> | |

DISBURSEMENTS

| | | | | |
|-----------|------------------------------------|--|----------------|--|
| Apr-01-13 | Photocopies - 203 BW @ \$0.10 each | | 20.30 | |
| | Totals | | <u>\$20.30</u> | |

Total Fee & Disbursements \$1,420.30

Balance Now Due \$1,420.30

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

May 1, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0003

Inv #: 8026

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-----------|--|-------|--------|--------|
| Apr-09-13 | Receipt and review of research; assign task to associate | 0.50 | 75.00 | LSB |
| | Legal research regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 0.50 | 62.50 | JHL |
| | Correspondence to LSB regarding subpoenas issued under the Administrative Procedure Act. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Apr-12-13 | Discussed legal issues regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Apr-15-13 | Review draft and revise draft; writ of attachment | 1.50 | 225.00 | LSB |
| | Review of revision in document | 0.25 | 37.50 | LSB |
| | Legal research regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 0.80 | 100.00 | JHL |
| | Preparation of Petition for Writ of Attachment. | 1.00 | 125.00 | JHL |
| | Revised Petition for Writ of Attachment. | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |

| | | | | |
|-----------|--|------|-------------------|-----|
| | Prepared Order for Writ of Attachment. | 0.30 | 37.50 | JHL |
| | Prepared Affidavit [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 0.40 | 50.00 | JHL |
| Apr-16-13 | Email to [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] [REDACTED] regarding writ of attachment. | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| | Phone call from [REDACTED] regarding documents | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Revised affidavit for [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Apr-17-13 | Email on affidavit; email to Jenna | 0.20 | 30.00 | LSB |
| | Email to [REDACTED] regarding affidavit. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Apr-19-13 | Calendar and email confirmation; email to A. Dow | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |
| | Review of affidavit for [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 30.00 | LSB |
| | Prepared affidavit for [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| | Correspondence from [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Apr-22-13 | Calendar date and hearing | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |
| Apr-23-13 | Email to [REDACTED] regarding affidavit. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Apr-24-13 | Receipt and review of notice of hearing and subpoenas; respond by email | 0.25 | 37.50 | LSB |
| Apr-25-13 | Correspondence with [REDACTED] regarding affidavit. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Totals | 7.50 | <u>\$1,015.00</u> | |

DISBURSEMENTS

| | | | |
|-----------|------------------------------------|--|----------------|
| Apr-30-13 | Photocopies - 203 BW @ \$0.10 each | | 20.30 |
| | Totals | | <u>\$20.30</u> |

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$1,035.30

Invoice #: 8026

Page 3

May 1, 2013

Previous Balance

1,420.30

Previous Payments

1,420.30

Balance Now Due

\$1,035.30

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Apr-15-13 For Services Rendered

1,420.30

Total Payments

\$1,420.30

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

June 3, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0003

Inv #: 8151

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-----------|--|-------|--------|--------|
| May-06-13 | Email to [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| May-07-13 | Email from [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| May-08-13 | Final revisions to Petition for Writ of Attachment. | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| May-09-13 | Letter to Court regarding Petition for Writ of Attachment. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Revised Petition for Writ of Attachment. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| May-14-13 | Receipt and review of notice of subpoena to Burns | 0.20 | 30.00 | LSB |
| May-20-13 | Attend board hearing on Buhler | 2.75 | 412.50 | LSB |
| May-21-13 | Receipt and review of email from [REDACTED] on [REDACTED] | 0.25 | 37.50 | LSB |
| May-22-13 | Email from [REDACTED]; email to [REDACTED]; review of the [REDACTED] | 0.40 | 60.00 | LSB |
| | Receipt and review of memorandum in opposition to writ of attachment | 0.25 | 37.50 | LSB |
| May-28-13 | Receipt and review of signed agreement | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |

| | | | | |
|-----------|---|------|-----------------|-----|
| May-29-13 | Receipt and review of Notice from the Court regarding writ of attachment. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Totals | 4.65 | <u>\$680.00</u> | |

DISBURSEMENTS

| | | | |
|-----------|--|-------|-----------------|
| May-09-13 | Postage - to COC filing Petition for Writ of Attachment (plus return envelope) | 2.58 | |
| May-30-13 | Photocopies - 238 BW @ \$0.10 each | 23.80 | |
| | Totals | | <u>\$26.38</u> |
| | Total Fee & Disbursements | | <u>\$706.38</u> |
| | Previous Balance | | 1,035.30 |
| | Previous Payments | | 1,035.30 |
| | Balance Now Due | | <u>\$706.38</u> |

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

| | | |
|-----------|-----------------------|-------------------|
| May-09-13 | For Services Rendered | 1,035.30 |
| | Total Payments | <u>\$1,035.30</u> |

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

July 2, 2013

11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2

Suite C

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

File #: 1107-0003

Inv #: 8245

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-----------|--|-------|--------|--------|
| Jun-03-13 | Receipt and review of memorandum in [REDACTED] of motion for sanctions; assign task to associate | 0.50 | 75.00 | LSB |
| | Review of Burns' Memorandum in Support of Motion for Sanctions. | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| Jun-05-13 | Receipt and review of [REDACTED] and review of [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 30.00 | LSB |
| Jun-12-13 | Review of [REDACTED] allegations regarding [REDACTED] | 0.40 | 50.00 | JHL |
| | Legal research regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 1.50 | 187.50 | JHL |
| | Preparation of Opposition to Burns' Memorandum in Support of Motion for Sanctions. | 1.50 | 187.50 | JHL |
| Jun-13-13 | Review and revise memo [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 0.50 | 75.00 | LSB |
| | Revised [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |

| | | | | |
|-----------|---|------|----------|-----|
| | Letter to the Court regarding Opposition to Memorandum in Support of Sanctions. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Jun-21-13 | Correspondence from Burns regarding Opposition. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Jun-28-13 | Legal research regarding [REDACTED] | 0.40 | 50.00 | JHL |
| | Totals | 5.60 | \$730.00 | |

DISBURSEMENTS

| | | | |
|-----------|--|------|--------|
| Jun-13-13 | Postage - to COC filing Opposition to Motion in Support of Motion for Sanctions (plus return envelope) | 1.52 | |
| Jul-01-13 | Photocopies - 12 BW @ \$0.10 each | 1.20 | |
| | Totals | | \$2.72 |

Total Fee & Disbursements**\$732.72**

Previous Balance

706.38

Previous Payments

706.38

Balance Now Due**\$732.72**

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

| | | |
|-----------|-----------------------|-----------------|
| Jun-06-13 | For Services Rendered | 706.38 |
| | Total Payments | \$706.38 |

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

August 5, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0003

Inv #: 8369

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-----------|---|-------|--------|--------|
| Jun-03-13 | Receipt and review of memorandum in support of motion for sanctions; [REDACTED] | 0.50 | 75.00 | LSB |
| | Review of Burns' Memorandum in Support of Motion for Sanctions. | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| Jun-05-13 | Receipt and review of Judy Fasola letter to Tim Holt and review of Holt response to board | 0.20 | 30.00 | LSB |
| Jun-12-13 | Review of [REDACTED] | 0.40 | 50.00 | JHL |
| | Legal research regarding [REDACTED] | 1.50 | 187.50 | JHL |
| | Preparation of [REDACTED] | 1.50 | 187.50 | JHL |
| Jun-13-13 | Review and revise memo [REDACTED] | 0.50 | 75.00 | LSB |
| | Revised [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |

| | | | | |
|-----------|---|------|--------|-----|
| | Letter to the Court regarding Opposition to Memorandum in Support of Sanctions. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Jun-21-13 | Correspondence from [REDACTED] regarding Opposition. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Jun-28-13 | Legal research regarding [REDACTED] | 0.40 | 50.00 | JHL |
| Jul-15-13 | Receipt and review of memo in opposition to petition for writ of attachment | 0.30 | 45.00 | LSB |
| | Review of Burns' Memorandum in Opposition to Petition for Writ of Attachment. | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| Jul-17-13 | Correspondence from Judge's office regarding Opposition. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Jul-18-13 | Preparation for [REDACTED] | 0.50 | 62.50 | JHL |
| | Calculation of all [REDACTED] with writ of attachment. | 0.60 | 75.00 | JHL |
| | Preparation of [REDACTED] | 0.70 | 87.50 | JHL |
| | Discussed legal issues [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| Jul-19-13 | Phone call to [REDACTED]s regardin [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Review of pleadings and law in preparation for hearing on writ of attachment and hearing on Defendants' motion for sanctions. | 1.20 | 150.00 | JHL |
| Jul-22-13 | Attend hearing | 0.50 | 75.00 | LSB |
| | Hearing on Writ of Attachemnt and Defendant's Motion for Sanctions at the 19th JDC. | 1.10 | 0.00 | JHL |
| | Preparation for hearing on Writ of Attachment and Motion for Sanctions. | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| Jul-29-13 | Email to [REDACTED] on [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |
| Jul-30-13 | Correspondence from [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |

| | | |
|--------|-------|-------------------|
| Totals | 11.50 | <u>\$1,352.50</u> |
|--------|-------|-------------------|

DISBURSEMENTS

| | | |
|-----------|--|---------------|
| Jun-13-13 | Postage - to COC filing Opposition to Motion in Support of Motion for Sanctions (plus return envelope) | 1.52 |
| Jun-26-13 | Parking - Hearing at 19th Judicial District Court | 4.00 |
| Jul-01-13 | Photocopies - 12 BW @ \$0.10 each | 1.20 |
| Jul-31-13 | Photocopies - 22 BW at \$0.10 each | 2.20 |
| Totals | | <u>\$8.92</u> |

| | |
|--------------------------------------|------------------------|
| Total Fee & Disbursements | \$1,361.42 |
| Retainers Applied | 732.72 |
| Previous Balance | 706.38 |
| Previous Payments | 706.38 |
| Balance Now Due | <u>\$628.70</u> |

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

| | | |
|-----------------------|-----------------------|--------------------------|
| Jun-06-13 | For Services Rendered | 706.38 |
| Aug-05-13 | For Services Rendered | 732.72 |
| Total Payments | | <u>\$1,439.10</u> |

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

September 4, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0003
Inv #: 8463

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-------------|--------------------------------------|--------------|---------------|----------------|
| Aug-14-13 | Review of [REDACTED] | 0.25 | 37.50 | LSB |
| | Totals | 0.25 | <u>37.50</u> | |
| | Total Fee & Disbursements | | | <u>\$37.50</u> |
| | Previous Balance | | | 628.70 |
| | Previous Payments | | | 628.70 |
| | Balance Now Due | | | <u>\$37.50</u> |

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

| | | | | |
|-----------|-----------------------|--|--|-----------------|
| Aug-12-13 | For Services Rendered | | | 628.70 |
| | Total Payments | | | <u>\$628.70</u> |

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

October 2, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0003

Inv #: 8624

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-----------|--|-------|--------|--------|
| Sep-04-13 | Research on [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| | Phone call from [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Sep-05-13 | Review of [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Legal research regarding [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| | Email to [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Email from [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Prepared Judgment. | 0.30 | 37.50 | JHL |
| | Email to [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Correspondence with [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Sep-09-13 | Receipt and review of [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |
| | Review of revised draft judgment; [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 15.00 | LSB |

| | | | | |
|-----------|--|-------------|-----------------|-----|
| | Revised Judgment. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Email to [REDACTED] | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| Sep-11-13 | Correspondence from Burns regarding proposed judgment. | 0.10 | 12.50 | JHL |
| | Totals | 1.80 | \$230.00 | |

DISBURSEMENTS

| | | | |
|-----------|-----------------------------------|--|---------------|
| Sep-30-13 | Photocopies - 1 BW @ \$ 0.10 each | | 0.10 |
| | Totals | | \$0.10 |

| | |
|--------------------------------------|-----------------|
| Total Fee & Disbursements | \$230.10 |
| Previous Balance | 37.50 |
| Previous Payments | 37.50 |
| Balance Now Due | \$230.10 |

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

| | | |
|-----------|-----------------------|----------------|
| Sep-13-13 | For Services Rendered | 37.50 |
| | Total Payments | \$37.50 |

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

November 5, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0003

Inv #: 8803

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-----------|---|-------|----------|--------|
| Oct-02-13 | Review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 1.20 | 150.00 | JHL |
| Oct-03-13 | Finished reviewing the [REDACTED] [REDACTED] | 0.20 | 25.00 | JHL |
| | Totals | 1.40 | \$175.00 | |

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$175.00

Previous Balance

230.10

Previous Payments

230.10

Balance Now Due

\$175.00

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Oct-09-13 For Services Rendered

230.10

Total Payments

\$230.10

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

January 6, 2014

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0003

Inv #: 8977

RE: LALB v Ken Buhler and Estate Auction

| DATE | DESCRIPTION | HOURS | AMOUNT | LAWYER |
|-------------|--------------------------------------|--------------|---------------|----------------|
| Dec-02-13 | Attend hearing on motion | 0.50 | 75.00 | LSB |
| | Totals | 0.50 | <u>75.00</u> | |
| | Total Fee & Disbursements | | | <u>\$75.00</u> |
| | Balance Now Due | | | <u>\$75.00</u> |

TAX ID Number 20-5978929