

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

April 2, 2012

11736 Newcastle Building 2

Suite k

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

File #: 1107-0001

Attention:

Inv #: 5932

RE: Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Mar-09-12	Meeting with Sandy Edmonds, Ann Dow, Tessa SteinKemp at Board Office to review policy's, produces and actions to the board	2.50	375.00	LSB
Mar-12-12	Discussed legal issues concerning public comment with LSB.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Mar-13-12	Review of Auctioneers Licensing Board's public meeting rules.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Legal research regarding public comments and open meeting requirements.	0.30	37.50	JHL
Mar-16-12	Legal research regarding [REDACTED]	1.00	125.00	JHL
Mar-18-12	Review [REDACTED]	0.10	15.00	LSB
Mar-19-12	Legal research regarding [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Totals	4.40	\$615.00	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			\$615.00
	Balance Now Due			\$615.00

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

June 5, 2012

11736 Newcastle Building 2

Suite k

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

File #: 1107-0001

Inv #: 7096

Attention:**RE:** Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
May-14-12	Review of correspondence from [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Prepared letter to Board regarding [REDACTED]	0.30	45.00	LSB
	Legal research regarding statutes and case law concerning public records and recorders, right to examine in person, time of inspection, place of inspection.	1.60	240.00	LSB
	review of email and respond to email	0.20	30.00	LSB
	receipt and review of certified letter from Burns and public records	0.10	15.00	LSB
	review of [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
	review of draft letter on public comment	0.20	30.00	LSB
	review of email from [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
May-15-12	Prepared letter to Burns regarding public records request.	0.60	90.00	LSB
	Review of [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB

Invoice #: 7096

Page 2

June 5, 2012

	Legal research regarding Administrative procedure act, Auctioneers Licensing Board, cuases for revocation and suspension of license.	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Phone call from Sandy Edmonds regarding public records.	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Review of public records.	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Prepared [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00	LSB
	Email to Burns and Phillips regarding public records requests.	0.05	7.50	LSB
	Revised [REDACTED]	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Review of draft letter; email to LALB	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Meeting with Sandy Edmonds concerning public records request	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Review of [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Telephone call from Burns and Phillips	0.05	7.50	LSB
May-17-12	Phone call from Sandy Edmonds regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Meeting with Burns and Phillips	0.13	19.50	LSB
	Review of agenda for May 21, 2012; telephone call to Sandy Edmonds	0.25	37.50	LSB
May-21-12	Review of open meetings law and case law; email to Sandy Edmonds	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Attend board meeting	1.75	262.50	LSB
May-23-12	Telephone call to [REDACTED] telephone call to [REDACTED] prepare letter [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Review of minutes and emails from Burns	0.50	75.00	LSB

Invoice #: 7096

Page 3

June 5, 2012

May-31-12	Meeting with Anna Dow to review information concerning legal actions of the board and various law suits filed	1.20	180.00	LSB
Jun-04-12	Telephone call from Sandy Edmonds; telephone call to Anna Dow; review of email from Sandy; draft response letter to Burns on public records request	1.10	165.00	LSB
	Totals	11.93	\$1,789.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

	Photocopies	1.50
Apr-18-12	Photocopy Expense (6 B&W)	0.60
May-23-12	Postage Expense - to Sandy Edmonds	0.65
	Postage Expense - to [REDACTED]	5.75
	Postage Expense [REDACTED]	0.65
	Totals	\$9.15

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$1,798.65
Previous Balance	615.00
Previous Payments	615.00
Balance Now Due	\$1,798.65

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Apr-10-12	For Services Rendered	615.00
	Total Payments	\$615.00

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

August 1, 2012

11736 Newcastle Building 2

Suite k

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

File #: 1107-0001

Inv #: 7282

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

RE: Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jun-19-12	Review of file and email to confirm [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	15.00	LSB
Jun-30-12	Review of file; email [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
Jul-02-12	Review of file; telephone call to Dow concerning hearing process	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Review of file; telephone call to attorney for [REDACTED] letter to [REDACTED] concerning hearing	0.50	75.00	LSB
Jul-03-12	Telephone call from Bordelon; telephone call to Sandy; email to Sandy; telephone call to Sandy	0.40	60.00	LSB
	Review of [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
Jul-12-12	Telephone calls from Sandy regarding board meeting; telephone call concerning public comment period	0.40	60.00	LSB
	Review of email by Burns; draft letter; email to S. Edmonds	1.50	225.00	LSB
Jul-13-12	Email from Edmonds on Burns contact information; Review of [REDACTED] email to [REDACTED] telephone call to [REDACTED] drafting of letter	1.50	225.00	LSB

	Additional email from Edmonds; respond by email	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Review of agenda and email	0.10	15.00	LSB
Jul-16-12	Telephone call to [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Preparation for agenda; attend board meeting	2.00	300.00	LSB
Jul-17-12	Receipt and review of judgment; email to Dugas	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Review of [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
Jul-19-12	Telephone call from [REDACTED]	0.60	90.00	LSB
Jul-20-12	Email from client [REDACTED]	0.10	15.00	LSB
Jul-22-12	Email from Delaune on ROE issue; respond by email	0.10	15.00	LSB
Jul-25-12	Begin preparation of formal hearing document	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Totals	9.40	\$1,410.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

Jun-04-12	Postage Expense [REDACTED] - Certified Mail, Return Receipt Requested	5.55
Jun-28-12	Photocopies - 10 @ .10 BW	1.00
Jul-21-12	Postage - Letter to [REDACTED] - Certified Mail, Return Receipt Requested	5.55
Jul-26-12	Photocopies - 113 @ 0.15 color; 9 @ 0.10 BW	17.85
	Totals	\$29.95

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$1,439.95
Previous Balance	1,798.65
Previous Payments	1,798.65
Balance Now Due	\$1,439.95

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

September 4, 2012

11736 Newcastle Building 2

Suite C

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

File #: 1107-0001

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

Inv #: 7378

RE: Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Aug-10-12	Revise notice of hearing, email to Edmonds	1.00	150.00	LSB
	draft Notice of Hearing [REDACTED]	0.60	39.00	PL1
Aug-13-12	listen to recording from November 2011 meeting [REDACTED]	0.30	19.50	PL1
Aug-14-12	Final review of letter to [REDACTED] letter to [REDACTED] and draft violations	0.50	75.00	LSB
	letter to [REDACTED] with Notice of Hearing	0.30	19.50	PL1
	letter to [REDACTED] regarding representation of [REDACTED]	0.30	19.50	PL1
Aug-23-12	Telephone call to Sandy Edmonds regarding hearing date	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Telephone call to Sandy Edmonds; receipt of form subpoena; assign task to paralegal	0.50	75.00	LSB
Aug-24-12	Subpoena to [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
	draft subpoena to [REDACTED]	0.40	26.00	PL1
	draft letter to [REDACTED] regarding hearing	0.30	19.50	PL1

Aug-27-12	Letter to [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Revise Amended complaint	0.50	75.00	LSB
	letter to [REDACTED] with amended notice	0.30	19.50	PL1
	draft amended notice with additional allegation concerning [REDACTED]	0.40	26.00	PL1
	revise amended notice with additional allegations concerning [REDACTED]	0.10	6.50	PL1
Aug-30-12	Review of email and assign task to paralegal	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Totals	6.25	\$682.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

Aug-15-12	Postage - to [REDACTED] enc Notice of Hearing (Certified Mail, RRR)	5.75
	Postage [REDACTED] enc Notice of Hearing (Certified Mail, RRR)	5.75
Aug-24-12	Postage - Letter to [REDACTED] re hearing date	0.45
Aug-27-12	Postage - [REDACTED] (CM-RRR)	5.65
	Postage - to [REDACTED] re Amended Notice of Hearing (Certified Mail- RRR)	5.55
	Postage - copy of letter to [REDACTED] s to [REDACTED] Certified Mail - RRR)	5.55
Aug-31-12	Photocopy Expense - 7 BW @ 0.10 each	0.70
	Totals	\$29.40

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$711.90
Previous Balance	1,439.95
Previous Payments	1,439.95
Balance Now Due	\$711.90

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Invoice #: 7378

Page 3

September 4, 2012

Aug-13-12 For Services Rendered

1,439.95

Total Payments

\$1,439.95

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

October 2, 2012

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0001

Inv #: 7431

RE: Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Sep-10-12	Telephone call to Sandy Edmonds; telephone call to Anna Dow	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Telephone call to Anna Dow	0.10	15.00	LSB
Sep-12-12	begin preparation for hearing	2.00	130.00	PL1
Sep-14-12	continue review of [REDACTED]	6.00	390.00	PL1
Sep-16-12	Preparation for hearing	2.00	300.00	LSB
Sep-17-12	Attend board meeting and hearing on [REDACTED]	5.00	750.00	LSB
	prepare exhibits for hearing	1.00	65.00	PL1
	Totals	16.60	\$1,725.00	

DISBURSEMENTS

Sep-28-12	Photocopies - 10 color @ 0.15 each; 812 BW @ 0.10 each		82.70	
	Totals		\$82.70	

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$1,807.70
Previous Balance	711.90
Previous Payments	711.90
Balance Now Due	\$1,807.70

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Sep-13-12	For Services Rendered	711.90
	Total Payments	\$711.90

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2

Suite C

Baton Rouge, LA

70816

November 1, 2012

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0001

Inv #: 7525

RE: Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Oct-08-12	Review of findings of fact and conclusion	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Email from Edmonds; email Vallan regarding hearing	0.10	15.00	LSB
	Telephone call to Sandy Edmonds on [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
Oct-30-12	Telephone call to Sandy; telephone call to [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00	LSB
	Totals	1.60	\$240.00	

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$240.00

Previous Balance

1,807.70

Previous Payments

1,807.70

Balance Now Due

\$240.00

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Oct-12-12 For Services Rendered

1,807.70

Invoice #: 7525

Page 2

November 1, 2012

Total Payments

\$1,807.70

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

December 3, 2012

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0001

Inv #: 7597

RE: Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Nov-05-12	Attend monthly board meeting	1.25	187.50	LSB
Nov-14-12	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00	LSB
Nov-15-12	Telephone call with [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
Nov-27-12	Telephone call from client regarding public records request	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Respond to email regarding redacting of documents	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Research on court connect regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
Nov-28-12	Telephone call from [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
Nov-29-12	Meeting with Sandy Edmonds on public records request	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Email from [REDACTED] respond by email	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Totals	3.55	\$530.00	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			\$530.00

Invoice #: 7597

Page 2

December 3, 2012

Previous Balance	240.00
Previous Payments	240.00
Balance Now Due	\$530.00

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Nov-05-12	For Services Rendered	240.00
Total Payments		\$240.00