

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway
Suite A
Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

December 3, 2012

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 7598

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Nov-28-12	Correspondence with Sandy regarding public records request.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Legal research regarding public records law, exceptions, [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Legal research regarding counsel for boards and commissions, public officers and employees, ability to obtain special counsel, compensation, procedure.	0.90	112.50	JHL
Nov-29-12	Legal research regarding individual members liability for violation of open meetings law, standard burden of proof, civil penalties.	0.70	87.50	JHL
	Meeting with Sandy Edmonds regarding public records.	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Discussed legal issues with LSB regarding open meetings and executive session.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Correspondence with Sandy Edmonds regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Legal research regarding the administrative procedure act, due process, private deliberations [REDACTED]	1.40	175.00	JHL

	Review of Petition for Damages.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Prepared letter to [REDACTED] regarding public records request.	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Discussed legal issues with [REDACTED]	0.30	37.50	JHL
	Redacted B&A invoices.	0.50	62.50	JHL
	Review of [REDACTED]	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Legal research regarding administrative procedure, adjudication, procedure, licensure, hearings.	0.50	62.50	JHL
Nov-30-12	Review of public records.	1.20	150.00	JHL
	Totals	7.10	<u>\$887.50</u>	

DISBURSEMENTS

Nov-30-12	Photocopy Expense - 21 BW @ 0.10 each		2.10	
	Totals		<u>\$2.10</u>	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			<u>\$889.60</u>
	Balance Now Due			<u>\$889.60</u>

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

January 2, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0001

Inv #: 7665

RE: Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Dec-03-12	Review of email and email to [REDACTED] with audio link	0.30	45.00	LSB
	Telephone call from [REDACTED] [REDACTED] receipt and review of legal information from [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00	LSB
Dec-04-12	Receipt and review of email from Burns regarding executive order; email from Sandy Edmonds	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Email to Sandy regarding executive order issue	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Telephone call from [REDACTED] [REDACTED] decide how to proceed; receipt and review of email [REDACTED] assign task to associate	0.50	75.00	LSB
Dec-11-12	Telephone call from [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
Dec-12-12	Telephone call from Sandy; email from Sandy	0.10	15.00	LSB
Dec-21-12	Receipt and review of email from [REDACTED] respond by email	0.25	37.50	LSB
Dec-26-12	Draft letter to [REDACTED] email to Sandy	0.50	75.00	LSB
	Email from Edmonds regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	15.00	LSB

Email from Sandy Edmonds	0.10	15.00	LSB
Receipt and review of email from Burns; forward email to Sandy Edmonds	0.25	37.50	LSB
Email from [REDACTED]	0.25	37.50	LSB
Email from Sandy Edmonds; respond by email	0.20	30.00	LSB
Totals	3.60	<u>\$540.00</u>	

DISBURSEMENTS

Dec-07-12	Postage - Copy of Motion for Extension of Time to Judge Fields	0.45
Dec-26-12	Postage - Letter to [REDACTED] delivery of hearing (Certified Mail - Return Receipt Requested)	5.65
Dec-28-12	Photocopies - 6 BW @ \$0.10 each	0.60
Totals		<u>\$6.70</u>

Total Fee & Disbursements	<u>\$546.70</u>
Previous Balance	530.00
Previous Payments	530.00
Balance Now Due	<u>\$546.70</u>

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Dec-10-12	For Services Rendered	530.00
Total Payments		<u>\$530.00</u>

Bankston & Associates, L.L.C.

8708 Jefferson Highway

Suite A

Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Ph:(225) 766-3800

Fax:(225) 766-7800

Louisiana Auctioneers Licensing Board
11736 Newcastle Avenue, Building 2
Suite C
Baton Rouge, LA
70816

January 2, 2013

Attention: Ms. Sandy Edmonds

File #: 1107-0002

Inv #: 7666

RE: Robert Burns v. LA Auctioneering Board

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Dec-03-12	Review and redaction of public records.	2.00	250.00	JHL
	Meeting with Robert Burns to review public records requested.	2.30	287.50	JHL
Dec-04-12	Correspondence from [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Legal research regarding rules of professional conduct, conflict of interest re representation of board and individual members.	0.30	37.50	JHL
Dec-05-12	Review and draft [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00	LSB
	Email to Sandy regarding approval from Agency Fees.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Prepared [REDACTED]	0.60	75.00	JHL
Dec-06-12	Receipt and review of letter from [REDACTED] email to Edmonds regarding same	0.25	37.50	LSB
	Correspondence from Sandy Edmonds regarding approval for special counsel.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Dec-13-12	Correspondence from Sandy Edmonds regarding additional public records request.	0.10	12.50	JHL

	Phone call from Sandy regarding Burns' additional public records request.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Phone call from [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Phone call to [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email to Sandy regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Prepared letter to Burns regarding new public records request.	0.20	25.00	JHL
Dec-14-12	Receipt and review of public records request from Sandy.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Correspondence from Burn regarding public records request	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email to Burns regarding public records request.	0.10	12.50	JHL
	Email from Burns regarding public records request.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Dec-18-12	Review of public records provided by Sandy.	0.20	25.00	JHL
	Email from Burns regarding public records inspection.	0.10	12.50	JHL
Dec-20-12	Met with Burns for public records inspection.	1.30	162.50	JHL
Dec-26-12	Receipt and review of [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00	LSB
	Totals	9.05	\$1,152.50	

DISBURSEMENTS

Dec-14-12	Postage - Letter to [REDACTED] public records (Certified Mail - Return Receipt Requested)	5.55
Dec-28-12	Photocopies - 4 BW @ \$0.10 each	0.40
	Totals	\$5.95

Total Fee & Disbursements	\$1,158.45
Previous Balance	889.60
Previous Payments	889.60
Balance Now Due	\$1,158.45

TAX ID Number 20-5978929

PAYMENT DETAILS

Dec-10-12	For Services Rendered	889.60
	Total Payments	\$889.60